
Telegraph Street, Shipston-On-Stour, CV36 4DA



***BEAUTIFULLY PRESENTED TWO
BEDROOM MAISONETTE - UNDER
FLOOR HEATING THROUGHOUT***

A great opportunity to purchase this
two double bedroom maisonette
situated in the heart of Shipston-on-
Stour. The property is being offered to
the market with no onward chain and is
ideal for first time buyers and buy-to-let
investors.

The accommodation benefits from
under-floor heating throughout and
comprises; ground floor entrance hall
with stairs rising to the first floor
landing. On the first floor is an open-
plan sitting room with fully fitted
kitchen / breakfast room, double
bedroom and main bathroom. On the
second floor is a further double
bedroom with built-in wardrobes and
access to the loft which is fully insulated
and bordered with power and lighting.

Property Description



Key Features

• NO ONWARD CHAIN

• UNDERFLOOR HEATING
THROUGHOUT

• OPEN PLAN LIVING ROOM /
KITCHEN

• TWO DOUBLE BEDROOMS

• BATHROOM

• IDEAL FIRST TIME BUYERS /
PROPERTY INVESTMENT
PURCHASE

• LOCATED IN THE HEART OF
SHIPSTON-ON-STOUR

• EPC = C








